

City of Mt. Pleasant, Michigan  
2017-2018 Snow Hauling Bid

McGuirk Sand & Gravel, Inc.  
2420 E. Broomfield Rd.  
Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

Robbin Harsh Excavating, Inc.  
9395 S. Clare Ave.  
Clare, MI 48617

| <u>Item</u>  | <u>Equipment Description</u> | <u>Capacity</u> | <u>Cost Per Hour</u> | <u>Cost Per OT Hour</u> | <u>Cost per CYD</u> | <u>Equipment Description</u>     | <u>Capacity</u> | <u>Cost Per Hour</u> | <u>Cost Per OT Hour</u> | <u>Cost per CYD</u> |
|--|------------------------------|-----------------|----------------------|-------------------------|---------------------|----------------------------------|-----------------|----------------------|-------------------------|---------------------|
| Dump Truck & Operator  | Kenworth T-880               | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 120.00            | \$ 130.00               | \$ 2.63             | Freightliner w/4 axle steel tub  | 39-40 cyds      | \$ 108.00            | \$ 128.00               | \$ 2.70             |
|  | Kenworth T-880               | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 120.00            | \$ 130.00               | \$ 2.63             | International w/4 axle steel tub | 39-40 cyds      | \$ 108.00            | \$ 128.00               | \$ 2.70             |
|  | Kenworth T-880               | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 120.00            | \$ 130.00               | \$ 2.63             | International w/4 axle steel tub | 39-40 cyds      | \$ 108.00            | \$ 128.00               | \$ 2.70             |
| Dollar amount per hour contract will be discounted if awarded both 2017 Leaf Hauling and 2017-2018 Snow Hauling bids |                              |                 |                      |                         |                     |                                  |                 | *port to port        | *port to port           |                     |
|  |                              |                 |                      |                         |                     |                                  |                 | \$ 3.00              |                         | \$ 2.63             |

R & T Murphy Trucking  
1627 W. River Rd.  
Mt. Pleasant, MI 4888

Fisher Transportation Co., Inc.  
900 S. Bradley St.  
Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

| <u>Item</u>  | <u>Equipment Description</u> | <u>Capacity</u> | <u>Cost Per Hour</u> | <u>Cost Per OT Hour</u> | <u>Cost per CYD</u> | <u>Equipment Description</u> | <u>Capacity</u> | <u>Cost Per Hour</u> | <u>Cost Per OT Hour</u> | <u>Cost per CYD</u> |
|--|------------------------------|-----------------|----------------------|-------------------------|---------------------|------------------------------|-----------------|----------------------|-------------------------|---------------------|
| Dump Truck & Operator  | 2006 Kenworth                | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 125.00            | \$ 125.00               | \$ 2.74             | 5-Tractors w/4-axle leads    | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 130.00            | \$ 130.00               | \$ 2.85             |
|  | 2004 Kenworth                | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 125.00            | \$ 125.00               | \$ 2.74             | 25-Tractors w/3-axle leads   | 39 cyds         | \$ 112.00            | \$ 112.00               | \$ 2.87             |
|  | 2000 Kenworth                | 45.6 cyds       | \$ 125.00            | \$ 125.00               | \$ 2.74             |                              |                 |                      |                         |                     |
| Dollar amount per hour contract will be discounted if awarded both 2017 Leaf Hauling and 2017-2018 Snow Hauling bids |                              |                 |                      |                         |                     |                              |                 | \$ 2.50              |                         | \$2.80/\$2.81       |

Crawford Contracting No bid  
Isabella Corporation No bid  
Malley Construction No bid  
Pat McGuirk Exc. No bid