City of Mt. Pleasant

Tires, Tubes and Tire Services

for Fleet Vehicles

In Alphabetical Order

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

DIVISION I: TIRES FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES AND LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

P205/75R15 Uniroyall Tiger Paw AWP 8 $79.00 $632.00 Yes Cooper  SF340 SL $60.00 $480.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 8 $69.00 $552.00 No 1-2
P215/60R16 Dunlop Signature I 4 $90.00 $360.00 Yes Firestone FR710 SL $81.55 $326.20 No 1 Prometer LL600 4 $68.00 $272.00 No 1-2
P215/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler ST 4 $146.00 $584.00 Yes Kumho APT KL51 SL $115.00 $460.00 No 2 No bid $0.00

P215/85R16 Goodyear  Umsteel 12 $352.00 $4,224.00 No 2 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P225/70R15 Continental Contitrac 4 $133.00 $532.00 Yes Cooper  Trendsetter SL $90.00 $360.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $77.81 $311.24 No 1-2
P225/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 8 $147.00 $1,176.00 No 2 Firestone Dest. LE Il SL $125.00 $1,000.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $81.66 $653.28 No 1-2
P225/70R19.5 Goodyear Umsteel 16 $358.00 $5,728.00 No 2 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 $3,569.12 Yes 1 No bid $0.00

P225/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 8 $148.00 $1,184.00 No 2 Cooper  SF340 SL $90.00 $720.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 10 $81.00 $648.00 No 1-2
P235/70R16 Continental Contitrac 4 $159.00 $636.00 Yes Sailun Terramax HT SL $95.00 $380.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $86.00 $344.00 No 1-2
P235/85R16 Kelly Safari ATR 18 $151.00 $2,718.00 Yes No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P245/75R16 Dunlop Grand Trek AT20 24 $84.00 $2,016.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $132.47 $3,179.28 Yes 1 Starfire SF510 4 $99.61 $2,390.64 No 1-2
P245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 10 $230.00 $2,300.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $159.90 $1,599.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler RTS 8 $150.00 $1,200.00 Yes Firestone Dest. LE I SL $114.11 $912.88 No 1 National ~ Sentinel HT 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
P265/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 4 $200.00 $800.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $149.70 $598.80 No 1 Starfire SF510 4 $108.00 $432.00 No 1-2
LT 215/85R16 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $103.52 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $106.80 No 1-2
LT 225/70R19.5 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 Yes 1 Roadmaster R508 Drive 12 $159.65 No 1-2
LT 235/85R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $114.80 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $110.11 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R17 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $123.66 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $132.00 No 1-2
LT 265/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $129.22 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $125.00 No 1-2
DIVISION II: TIRES FOR HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS AND EQUIPMENT

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

6.90 x 9 Trailer tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Boat trailer o] $46.84 $374.72 Yes 1 Carlisle  USA Trail 6 $67.12 $536.96 No 1-2
8 x 14.5 LT Trailer tire 2 No bid $0.00 Blue Star Sport trail G $66.64 $133.28 Yes 1 Blue Star  Highway 12 $65.00 $130.00 No 1-2
10-16 Skid steer tire 2 No bid $0.00 No bid No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

10-16.5 Skid steer tire 6 No bid $0.00 Powerking Skid loader D $123.56  $741.36 Yes 1 Akuret  Suprtrak ES 8 $123.79 $742.74 No 1-2
11.2 x 24 Front backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 Akuret 324 D $229.80 $919.20 No 1 Forerunner QT1613 8 $183.60 $734.40 No 1-2
16.9 x 30 Backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 BKT AT621 E $884.80 $3,539.20 No 1 Forerunner  QH613 10 $457.00 $1,828.00 No 1-2
17.5 x 24 Rear backhoe tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Lug 1 E $456.26  $3,650.09 No 1 BKT TR459 10 $454.00 $3,632.00 No 1-2
18 x 16.5 Tractor tire 4 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

18.4 x 38 Tractor tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone SAT Il 230 D $749.00 $1,498.00 No 1 Forerunner QH8001 10 $638.00 $1,276.00 No 1-2
19.5 x 24 Backhoe tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone All Trac Utility E $710.00 $1,420.00 No 1 Forerunner ~ QH601 12 $457.00 $914.00 No 1-2
20.5 x 25 12-ply Loader tire 8 No bid $0.00 Firestone SGG L-2 F $1,098.72 $8,789.76 No 1 Akvret L-D L2 12 $975.00 $7,800.00 No 1-2
22 9.5 x 10 Mower tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Turf Tras RS $70.00 $280.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Tracks 4 $75.40 $301.60 No BO
23 x 10.5 x 12 Mower tire 6 No bid $0.00 Nanco Super Lug $65.00 $390.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Master 4 $79.75 $478.50 No 1-2
24 x 10.5 x 10 Mower tire 8 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $720.00 No 1 Carlisle All Trail 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
25 x 12 ATV / Gator tire 6 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $540.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

F78-14 LT Trailer tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Sport Trail $62.00 $248.00 Yes 1 Carlisle Sport Trailer 6 $59.75 $239.00 No 1-2
335-80-18 Wheel loader tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone Dura Force $651.59 $1,303.48 No 1 Carlisle  Trac Chief 12 $308.00 $616.00 No 1-2

Recapped Tires —

Manufacturer’s Warranty Applies

11R22.5 drive tire

Unit Price w/Tire Casing

Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/o Tire

Casing Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$135.52

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$225.52

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

OPMS $161.24

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$286.24
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City of Mt. Pleasant
Tires, Tubes and Tire Services
for Fleet Vehicles

DIVISION lllI: Service Work

A Parts and Materials (excluding tires)

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items

B Tire Repair Accessories
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

C Tire Balancing Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

D Tire Disposal Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - Including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

E Miscellaneous Tire Services (Answer yes/no to all and provide pricing
24-Hours, 7-days-a-week on-call service available?
Does your company recap truck tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Does your company recap tractor tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Are recapped tires available for sale?
Cost:
Does your company fill tractor tires with chloride?
Cost for this service:

F Tire Services - Emergency / Disaster Events
Outfitted tire service truck and mechanic with necessary parts
and materials, on an as-needed basis

G Tire Mounting/Dismounting Fees (added 4/28/14)
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

Unit
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Unit
Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Yes

Unit

Per Hr

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
$19.99 Per Patch $5.00
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $18.50
Per Patch $5.00
Each $15.00
Each $12.00
Each $18.00
Each $15.00
Each N/A
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $4.50
Each $9.00
Each $3.00
Each $18.00
No Yes No
X
X
$135.52
X
X
$225.52
X
$20.00
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr $65.00
Each $6.00
Each $8.00
Each $18.00
Each $6.00
Each $35.00

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items %
%  Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items %
Unit Unit Cost
Per Patch $14.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $40.00
Per Patch $14.00
Each $9.00
Each $20.00
Each $20.00
Each $9.00
Each N/A
Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $8.00
Each $8.00
Each $3.00
Each $40.00
Yes No
X
X On customer's casing
$161.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
X Vendor supplies casing
$286.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
$1.50 gallon
Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr No bid
Each $6.00
Each $12.00
Each $12.00
Each $3.00 15"
Each $50.00
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City of Mt. Pleasant

Tires, Tubes and Tire Services

for Fleet Vehicles

In Alphabetical Order

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

DIVISION I: TIRES FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES AND LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

P205/75R15 Uniroyall Tiger Paw AWP 8 $79.00 $632.00 Yes Cooper  SF340 SL $60.00 $480.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 8 $69.00 $552.00 No 1-2
P215/60R16 Dunlop Signature I 4 $90.00 $360.00 Yes Firestone FR710 SL $81.55 $326.20 No 1 Prometer LL600 4 $68.00 $272.00 No 1-2
P215/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler ST 4 $146.00 $584.00 Yes Kumho APT KL51 SL $115.00 $460.00 No 2 No bid $0.00

P215/85R16 Goodyear  Umsteel 12 $352.00 $4,224.00 No 2 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P225/70R15 Continental Contitrac 4 $133.00 $532.00 Yes Cooper  Trendsetter SL $90.00 $360.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $77.81 $311.24 No 1-2
P225/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 8 $147.00 $1,176.00 No 2 Firestone Dest. LE Il SL $125.00 $1,000.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $81.66 $653.28 No 1-2
P225/70R19.5 Goodyear Umsteel 16 $358.00 $5,728.00 No 2 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 $3,569.12 Yes 1 No bid $0.00

P225/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 8 $148.00 $1,184.00 No 2 Cooper  SF340 SL $90.00 $720.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 10 $81.00 $648.00 No 1-2
P235/70R16 Continental Contitrac 4 $159.00 $636.00 Yes Sailun Terramax HT SL $95.00 $380.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $86.00 $344.00 No 1-2
P235/85R16 Kelly Safari ATR 18 $151.00 $2,718.00 Yes No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P245/75R16 Dunlop Grand Trek AT20 24 $84.00 $2,016.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $132.47 $3,179.28 Yes 1 Starfire SF510 4 $99.61 $2,390.64 No 1-2
P245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 10 $230.00 $2,300.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $159.90 $1,599.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler RTS 8 $150.00 $1,200.00 Yes Firestone Dest. LE I SL $114.11 $912.88 No 1 National ~ Sentinel HT 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
P265/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 4 $200.00 $800.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $149.70 $598.80 No 1 Starfire SF510 4 $108.00 $432.00 No 1-2
LT 215/85R16 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $103.52 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $106.80 No 1-2
LT 225/70R19.5 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 Yes 1 Roadmaster R508 Drive 12 $159.65 No 1-2
LT 235/85R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $114.80 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $110.11 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R17 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $123.66 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $132.00 No 1-2
LT 265/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $129.22 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $125.00 No 1-2
DIVISION II: TIRES FOR HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS AND EQUIPMENT

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

6.90 x 9 Trailer tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Boat trailer o] $46.84 $374.72 Yes 1 Carlisle  USA Trail 6 $67.12 $536.96 No 1-2
8 x 14.5 LT Trailer tire 2 No bid $0.00 Blue Star Sport trail G $66.64 $133.28 Yes 1 Blue Star  Highway 12 $65.00 $130.00 No 1-2
10-16 Skid steer tire 2 No bid $0.00 No bid No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

10-16.5 Skid steer tire 6 No bid $0.00 Powerking Skid loader D $123.56  $741.36 Yes 1 Akuret  Suprtrak ES 8 $123.79 $742.74 No 1-2
11.2 x 24 Front backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 Akuret 324 D $229.80 $919.20 No 1 Forerunner QT1613 8 $183.60 $734.40 No 1-2
16.9 x 30 Backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 BKT AT621 E $884.80 $3,539.20 No 1 Forerunner  QH613 10 $457.00 $1,828.00 No 1-2
17.5 x 24 Rear backhoe tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Lug 1 E $456.26  $3,650.09 No 1 BKT TR459 10 $454.00 $3,632.00 No 1-2
18 x 16.5 Tractor tire 4 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

18.4 x 38 Tractor tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone SAT Il 230 D $749.00 $1,498.00 No 1 Forerunner QH8001 10 $638.00 $1,276.00 No 1-2
19.5 x 24 Backhoe tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone All Trac Utility E $710.00 $1,420.00 No 1 Forerunner ~ QH601 12 $457.00 $914.00 No 1-2
20.5 x 25 12-ply Loader tire 8 No bid $0.00 Firestone SGG L-2 F $1,098.72 $8,789.76 No 1 Akvret L-D L2 12 $975.00 $7,800.00 No 1-2
22 9.5 x 10 Mower tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Turf Tras RS $70.00 $280.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Tracks 4 $75.40 $301.60 No BO
23 x 10.5 x 12 Mower tire 6 No bid $0.00 Nanco Super Lug $65.00 $390.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Master 4 $79.75 $478.50 No 1-2
24 x 10.5 x 10 Mower tire 8 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $720.00 No 1 Carlisle All Trail 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
25 x 12 ATV / Gator tire 6 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $540.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

F78-14 LT Trailer tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Sport Trail $62.00 $248.00 Yes 1 Carlisle Sport Trailer 6 $59.75 $239.00 No 1-2
335-80-18 Wheel loader tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone Dura Force $651.59 $1,303.48 No 1 Carlisle  Trac Chief 12 $308.00 $616.00 No 1-2

Recapped Tires —

Manufacturer’s Warranty Applies

11R22.5 drive tire

Unit Price w/Tire Casing

Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/o Tire

Casing Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$135.52

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$225.52

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

OPMS $161.24

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$286.24
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City of Mt. Pleasant
Tires, Tubes and Tire Services
for Fleet Vehicles

DIVISION lllI: Service Work

A Parts and Materials (excluding tires)

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items

B Tire Repair Accessories
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

C Tire Balancing Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

D Tire Disposal Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - Including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

E Miscellaneous Tire Services (Answer yes/no to all and provide pricing
24-Hours, 7-days-a-week on-call service available?
Does your company recap truck tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Does your company recap tractor tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Are recapped tires available for sale?
Cost:
Does your company fill tractor tires with chloride?
Cost for this service:

F Tire Services - Emergency / Disaster Events
Outfitted tire service truck and mechanic with necessary parts
and materials, on an as-needed basis

G Tire Mounting/Dismounting Fees (added 4/28/14)
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

Unit
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Unit
Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Yes

Unit

Per Hr

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
$19.99 Per Patch $5.00
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $18.50
Per Patch $5.00
Each $15.00
Each $12.00
Each $18.00
Each $15.00
Each N/A
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $4.50
Each $9.00
Each $3.00
Each $18.00
No Yes No
X
X
$135.52
X
X
$225.52
X
$20.00
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr $65.00
Each $6.00
Each $8.00
Each $18.00
Each $6.00
Each $35.00

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items %
%  Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items %
Unit Unit Cost
Per Patch $14.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $40.00
Per Patch $14.00
Each $9.00
Each $20.00
Each $20.00
Each $9.00
Each N/A
Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $8.00
Each $8.00
Each $3.00
Each $40.00
Yes No
X
X On customer's casing
$161.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
X Vendor supplies casing
$286.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
$1.50 gallon
Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr No bid
Each $6.00
Each $12.00
Each $12.00
Each $3.00 15"
Each $50.00
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City of Mt. Pleasant

Tires, Tubes and Tire Services

for Fleet Vehicles

In Alphabetical Order

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

DIVISION I: TIRES FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES AND LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

P205/75R15 Uniroyall Tiger Paw AWP 8 $79.00 $632.00 Yes Cooper  SF340 SL $60.00 $480.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 8 $69.00 $552.00 No 1-2
P215/60R16 Dunlop Signature I 4 $90.00 $360.00 Yes Firestone FR710 SL $81.55 $326.20 No 1 Prometer LL600 4 $68.00 $272.00 No 1-2
P215/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler ST 4 $146.00 $584.00 Yes Kumho APT KL51 SL $115.00 $460.00 No 2 No bid $0.00

P215/85R16 Goodyear  Umsteel 12 $352.00 $4,224.00 No 2 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P225/70R15 Continental Contitrac 4 $133.00 $532.00 Yes Cooper  Trendsetter SL $90.00 $360.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $77.81 $311.24 No 1-2
P225/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 8 $147.00 $1,176.00 No 2 Firestone Dest. LE Il SL $125.00 $1,000.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $81.66 $653.28 No 1-2
P225/70R19.5 Goodyear Umsteel 16 $358.00 $5,728.00 No 2 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 $3,569.12 Yes 1 No bid $0.00

P225/75R15 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 8 $148.00 $1,184.00 No 2 Cooper  SF340 SL $90.00 $720.00 Yes 1 Goodride ST Trailer 10 $81.00 $648.00 No 1-2
P235/70R16 Continental Contitrac 4 $159.00 $636.00 Yes Sailun Terramax HT SL $95.00 $380.00 Yes 1 GT Radial Max Tour 4 $86.00 $344.00 No 1-2
P235/85R16 Kelly Safari ATR 18 $151.00 $2,718.00 Yes No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

P245/75R16 Dunlop Grand Trek AT20 24 $84.00 $2,016.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $132.47 $3,179.28 Yes 1 Starfire SF510 4 $99.61 $2,390.64 No 1-2
P245/75R17 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 10 $230.00 $2,300.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $159.90 $1,599.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler RTS 8 $150.00 $1,200.00 Yes Firestone Dest. LE I SL $114.11 $912.88 No 1 National ~ Sentinel HT 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
P265/75R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 4 $200.00 $800.00 Yes Firestone Dest. AT SL $149.70 $598.80 No 1 Starfire SF510 4 $108.00 $432.00 No 1-2
LT 215/85R16 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $103.52 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $106.80 No 1-2
LT 225/70R19.5 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone F5560 F $223.07 Yes 1 Roadmaster R508 Drive 12 $159.65 No 1-2
LT 235/85R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $114.80 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $110.11 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $118.80 No 1-2
LT 245/75R17 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans HT E $123.66 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $132.00 No 1-2
LT 265/75R16 0 No bid $0.00 Firestone Trans AT E $129.22 Yes 1 National ~ Sentinel AT 10 $125.00 No 1-2
DIVISION II: TIRES FOR HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS AND EQUIPMENT

PLY EST UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY PLY UNIT IN STOCK? DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION MFG. MODEL RATING QTY PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days) MFG. MODEL RATING PRICE TOTAL Yes or No (in days)

6.90 x 9 Trailer tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Boat trailer o] $46.84 $374.72 Yes 1 Carlisle  USA Trail 6 $67.12 $536.96 No 1-2
8 x 14.5 LT Trailer tire 2 No bid $0.00 Blue Star Sport trail G $66.64 $133.28 Yes 1 Blue Star  Highway 12 $65.00 $130.00 No 1-2
10-16 Skid steer tire 2 No bid $0.00 No bid No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

10-16.5 Skid steer tire 6 No bid $0.00 Powerking Skid loader D $123.56  $741.36 Yes 1 Akuret  Suprtrak ES 8 $123.79 $742.74 No 1-2
11.2 x 24 Front backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 Akuret 324 D $229.80 $919.20 No 1 Forerunner QT1613 8 $183.60 $734.40 No 1-2
16.9 x 30 Backhoe tire 4 No bid $0.00 BKT AT621 E $884.80 $3,539.20 No 1 Forerunner  QH613 10 $457.00 $1,828.00 No 1-2
17.5 x 24 Rear backhoe tire 8 No bid $0.00 Powerking Lug 1 E $456.26  $3,650.09 No 1 BKT TR459 10 $454.00 $3,632.00 No 1-2
18 x 16.5 Tractor tire 4 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00

18.4 x 38 Tractor tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone SAT Il 230 D $749.00 $1,498.00 No 1 Forerunner QH8001 10 $638.00 $1,276.00 No 1-2
19.5 x 24 Backhoe tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone All Trac Utility E $710.00 $1,420.00 No 1 Forerunner ~ QH601 12 $457.00 $914.00 No 1-2
20.5 x 25 12-ply Loader tire 8 No bid $0.00 Firestone SGG L-2 F $1,098.72 $8,789.76 No 1 Akvret L-D L2 12 $975.00 $7,800.00 No 1-2
22 9.5 x 10 Mower tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Turf Tras RS $70.00 $280.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Tracks 4 $75.40 $301.60 No BO
23 x 10.5 x 12 Mower tire 6 No bid $0.00 Nanco Super Lug $65.00 $390.00 No 1 Carlisle  Turf Master 4 $79.75 $478.50 No 1-2
24 x 10.5 x 10 Mower tire 8 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $720.00 No 1 Carlisle All Trail 4 $97.00 $776.00 No 1-2
25 x 12 ATV / Gator tire 6 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  All Trail Il $90.00 $540.00 No 1 No bid $0.00

F78-14 LT Trailer tire 4 No bid $0.00 Carlisle  Sport Trail $62.00 $248.00 Yes 1 Carlisle Sport Trailer 6 $59.75 $239.00 No 1-2
335-80-18 Wheel loader tire 2 No bid $0.00 Firestone Dura Force $651.59 $1,303.48 No 1 Carlisle  Trac Chief 12 $308.00 $616.00 No 1-2

Recapped Tires —

Manufacturer’s Warranty Applies

11R22.5 drive tire

Unit Price w/Tire Casing

Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/o Tire

Casing Exchange (ea)

No bid

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$135.52

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$225.52

Unit Price w/Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

OPMS $161.24

Unit Price w/o Tire
Casing Exchange (ea)

$286.24
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City of Mt. Pleasant
Tires, Tubes and Tire Services
for Fleet Vehicles

DIVISION lllI: Service Work

A Parts and Materials (excluding tires)

Krapohl Ford / Lincoln
1415 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items

B Tire Repair Accessories
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

C Tire Balancing Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Heavy Equipment - including loaders, backhoes, etc.
Trailers

D Tire Disposal Fees
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) ton to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - Including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

E Miscellaneous Tire Services (Answer yes/no to all and provide pricing
24-Hours, 7-days-a-week on-call service available?
Does your company recap truck tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Does your company recap tractor tires?
Cost for this service (each):
Are recapped tires available for sale?
Cost:
Does your company fill tractor tires with chloride?
Cost for this service:

F Tire Services - Emergency / Disaster Events
Outfitted tire service truck and mechanic with necessary parts
and materials, on an as-needed basis

G Tire Mounting/Dismounting Fees (added 4/28/14)
Passenger and Light Duty Trucks - up to one (1) ton
Medium Duty Trucks - above one (1) to five (5) tons
Heavy Duty Trucks - above five (5) tons
Trailers
Heavy Equipment - including wheel loaders, backhoes, etc.

Unit
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch
Per Patch

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Unit
Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Yes

Unit

Per Hr

Each
Each
Each
Each
Each

Mt. Pleasant Tire Service, Inc.
120 S. Fancher Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items
% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
$19.99 Per Patch $5.00
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $12.50
Per Patch $18.50
Per Patch $5.00
Each $15.00
Each $12.00
Each $18.00
Each $15.00
Each N/A
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $4.50
Each $9.00
Each $3.00
Each $18.00
No Yes No
X
X
$135.52
X
X
$225.52
X
$20.00
Unit Cost Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr $65.00
Each $6.00
Each $8.00
Each $18.00
Each $6.00
Each $35.00

Olson Tire Service, Inc.
704 E. Pickard Street
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

% Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division | items %
%  Discount (if any) off retail price for parts and materials for Division Il items %
Unit Unit Cost
Per Patch $14.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $20.00
Per Patch $40.00
Per Patch $14.00
Each $9.00
Each $20.00
Each $20.00
Each $9.00
Each N/A
Unit Unit Cost
Each $3.00
Each $8.00
Each $8.00
Each $3.00
Each $40.00
Yes No
X
X On customer's casing
$161.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
X Vendor supplies casing
$286.24 11R225 OPMS Drives
X
$1.50 gallon
Unit Unit Cost
Per Hr No bid
Each $6.00
Each $12.00
Each $12.00
Each $3.00 15"
Each $50.00
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