
SPECIES
Bay Landscaping, Inc.      

Essexville, MI

Kankakee Nursery      

Aroma Park, IL

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.     

Springville, NY
SPECIES

Bay Landscaping, Inc.      

Essexville, MI

Kankakee Nursery      

Aroma Park, IL

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.     

Springville, NY

Eucommia ulmoides  - 15 trees                                 

(Hardy Rubber Tree) No bid No bid

$110.00/ea                       

(bid unacceptable 

substitute - Ginko biloba 

'Saratoga')

Acer x freemanii 'Autumn Blaze'  

(Autumn Blaze Maple)                      

2 trees No bid $77.00/ea $74.00/ea

Malus x 'Brandywine'  - 12 trees                           

(Brandywine Crabapple)                                     

Acceptable substitute:                                

Malus x 'Prairie Rose' or 'Klehm's 

Improved'                          No bid $45.00/ea

$53.00/ea                         

(bid Malus x 'Klehm's 

Improved'

Ginkgo biloba Maidenhair           

(Male only per Ordinance)                     

6 trees                              

Acceptable substitute:                           

Ginkgo biloba 'Magyar' or 'Halka' No bid $90.00/ea $110.00/ea

Malus x 'Spring Snow' - 12 trees                     

(Spring Snow Crabapple)                                       

Acceptable substitute:                     

Malus x 'Snowdrift' (Snowdrift 

Crabapple) No bid $53.00/ea $59.00/ea

Zelkova serrata 'Green Vase'          

(Green Vase Zelkova)                        

2 trees                                                      

Acceptable substitute:  Zelkova 

serrata 'Wireless' or 'Village Green' No bid No bid $78.00/ea

Prunus serrulata 'Kwanzan'                        

20 trees                                                               

(Kwanzan Flowering Cherry)                         

Acceptable substitute: Prunus 

yedoensis 'Yoshino' (Yoshino Cherry) 

or 'Autumnalis' No bid No bid

$58.00/ea                      

(bid Prunus subhirtella 

'Autumnalis'

Quercus acutissima                        

(Sawtooth Oak)                                    

2 trees                                  

Acceptable substitute:                                     

Quercus rubra (red oak) No bid $64.00/ea

$68.00/ea                                        

(bid Quercus rubra - 

Red oak)

Pyrus calleryana x 'Redspire'                                

(Redspire Pear)                                                 

20 trees                                   

Acceptable subsitute: Pyrus 

calleryana 'Aristocrat' or 'Capital' No bid $57.00/ea $74.00/ea

TOTAL DIVISION II N/A $822.00 $1,100.00

Quercus rubra (Red Oak)                       

30 trees                                   

Acceptable substitute:                      

Quercus palustris (Pin Oak) No bid $64.00/ea $68.00/ea

TOTAL BOTH DIVISIONS N/A $7,029.00 $11,888.00

Syringa reticulata - 15 trees                                        

(Japanese Tree Lilac) No bid $73.00/ea $78.00/ea

Ulmus x 'Frontier' - 12 trees                                     

(Frontier Elm) No bid $73.00/ea $81.00/ea

Ulmus x 'Morton' - 12 trees                                        

(Morton Elm) No bid No bid $81.00/ea

TOTAL DIVISION I N/A $6,207.00 $10,788.00

CITY OF MT. PLEASANT
  2013 SPRING TREE BID TABULATION

DIVISION IIDIVISION I



SPECIES
Bay Landscaping, Inc.      

Essexville, MI

Kankakee Nursery      

Aroma Park, IL

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.     

Springville, NY
SPECIES

Bay Landscaping, Inc.      

Essexville, MI

Kankakee Nursery      

Aroma Park, IL

Schichtel's Nursery, Inc.     

Springville, NY

Eucommia ulmoides                                

(Hardy Rubber Tree)                                              

Quantity up to 15 trees                                 No bid No bid No bid

Acer x freemanii 'Autumn Blaze'  

(Autumn Blaze Maple)                      

Quantity up to 2 trees $78.00/ea $77.00/ea No bid

Malus x 'Brandywine'                            

(Brandywine Crabapple)                                          

Quantity up to 12 trees                                                                   

Acceptable substitute:                                

Malus x 'Prairie Rose' or 'Klehm's 

Improved'                            

$72.00/ea,                                                     

(bid Prairiefire 

Crabapple) $45.00/ea No bid

Ginkgo biloba Maidenhair           

(Male only per Ordinance)                     

Quantity up to 6 trees                              

Acceptable substitute:                         

Ginkgo biloba 'Magyar' or 'Halka' $89.00/ea $90.00/ea No bid

Malus x 'Spring Snow'                      

(Spring Snow Crabapple)                                  

Quantity up to 12 trees             

Acceptable substitute:                     

Malus x 'Snowdrift' (Snowdrift 

Crabapple)

$72.00/ea,                                                     

(bid Adirondack 

Crabapple) $53.00/ea No bid

Zelkova serrata 'Green Vase'          

(Green Vase Zelkova)                        

Quantity up to 2 trees                            

Acceptable substitute:  Zelkova 

serrata 'Wireless' or 'Village Green' No bid No bid No bid

Prunus serrulata 'Kwanzan'                        

(Kwanzan Flowering Cherry)                            

Quantity up to 20 trees           

Acceptable substitute: Prunus 

yedoensis 'Yoshino' (Yoshino Cherry) 

or 'Autumnalis' $79.00/ea,          No bid No bid

Quercus acutissima                        

(Sawtooth Oak)                                    

Quantity up to 2 trees                                  

Acceptable substitute:                        

Quercus rubra (red oak) No bid $64.00/ea No bid

Pyrus calleryana x 'Redspire'                   

(Redspire Pear)                                  

Quantity up to 20 trees

$79.00/ea,                                    

(bid Cleveland 

Select) $57.00/ea No bid
TOTAL DIVISION II - ALTERNATE $690.00 $822.00 N/A

Quercus rubra (Red Oak)                  

Quantity up to 30 trees        

Acceptable substitute:                      

Quercus palustris (Pin Oak) No bid $64.00/ea No bid

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID $7,438.00 $7,029.00 N/A

Syringa reticulata                                         

(Japanese Tree Lilac)                           

Quantities up to 15 trees No bid $73.00/ea No bid

Ulmus x 'Frontier'                                      

(Frontier Elm)                                         

Quanitity up to 12 trees $76.00/ea,              $73.00/ea No bid

Ulmus x 'Morton'                                         

(Morton Elm)                               

Quantities up to 12 trees $79.00/ea,              No bid No bid

TOTAL DIVISION I - ALTERNATE $6,748.00 $6,207.00 N/A

Acorn Farms (Galena, OH) Horrocks Nursery Farms (Ionia, MI) Sharp Top Trees (White, GA)

Baldwin Tree Farm (Brighton, MI) KLM Landscape & Snow (Washington, MI) St. Aubin Nursery (Kirkland, IL)

Bork Tree Farms (Hinckley, MN) Marine City Nursery (China, MI) Twin City Landscape (St. Louis, MI)

Cottage Gardens, Inc. (Lansing, MI) Mapleglen Tree Farm (Weidman, MI)

County Line Nursery (Hartford, MI) Nature Hills Nursery (Omaha, NE)

Covey Tree Co. (Frewsburg, NY) Ope's Landscaping (Saginaw, MI)

Green Scene Lndspg. (Mt. Pleasant) Schaeffer's Tree Farm (Mt. Pleasant)

ALTERNATE BID

DIVISION I DIVISION II

NO BIDS RECEIVED FROM:


