
SPECIES
Bay Landscaping, Inc. 

1630 Boutell Rd.  

Essexville, MI  48732

John Deere Landscapes  

1385 East 36th St.  

Cleveland, OH  44114

Schaeffer's Christmas 

Tree Farm & Nursery  552 

S. Whiteville Rd.  Mt. 

Plesant, MI  48858

Schichtel's Nursery Inc.   

7420 Peters Rd.    

Springville, NY  14141

KLM Landscape             

66033 Mt. Vernon   

Washington, MI  48095

Ope's Landscaping Inc.  

P.O. Box 5473          

Saginaw, MI  48603

Acer miyabei                                               

(Miyabei Maple) NO BID

$108.00  EA.                          

(1-3/4" Diameter) $44.85 EA. $43.00 EA. $90.00 EA. $107.00 EA.

Eucommia ulmoides                                   

(Hardy Rubber Tree) NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.00 EA. $90.00 EA.

6 @ $91.50 EA. 1st load; 

5 @ $88.00 EA. 2nd 

load

Malus x 'Brandywine'                               

(Brandywine Crabapple)                                     

Acceptable substitute:                                

Malus x 'Prairie Rose'                            

(Prairie Rose Crabapple) NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.00 EA. $70.00 EA. $84.00 EA.

Malus x 'Prairifire'                                       

(Prairifire Crabapple)                       

Acceptable substitute:                     

Malus x 'Profusion'                             

(Profusion Crabapple) NO BID

$85.00 EA.                           

(1-3/4" Diameter; 2nd 

load only; Delivery not 

according to specs)

$75.40 EA. or $87.10 EA. 

(2" Diameter; 1st load 

only; Delivery not 

according to specs) $41.00 EA. $45.00 EA. $81.00 EA.

Malus x 'Spring Snow'                      

(Spring Snow Crabapple)                                       

Acceptable substitute:                     

Malus x 'Snowdrift' (Snowdrift 

Crabapple)

$51.00 EA. 

(Substituting Malus 

x 'Snowdrift')

$85.00 EA.                           

(1-3/4" Diameter; 2nd 

load only; Delivery not 

according to specs)

$54.86 EA. (2nd load 

only;  Delivery not 

according to specs) $45.00 EA. $40.00 EA.

6 @ $80.00 EA. 1st load; 

12 @ $82.00 EA. 2nd 

load

Metasequoia glyptostroboides                      

(Dawn Redwood) NO BID

$102.00 EA.                           

(1-3/4" Diameter; 2nd 

load only; Delivery not 

according to specs)

$20.80 EA. (1st load 

only; Delivery not 

according to specs) $58.00 EA. $52.00 EA. $100.00 EA.

Prunus serrulata 'Kwanzan'                        

(Kwanzan Flowering Cherry)                         

Acceptable substitute: Prunus 

yedoensis 'Yoshino' (Yoshino Cherry) $57.00 EA. NO BID NO BID $46.00 EA.

10 @ $80.00 EA. 1st 

load; 6 @ $59.00 EA. 

2nd load $97.00 EA.

Pyrus calleryana x 'Redspire'                   

(Redspire Pear) $58.00 EA.

$108.00 EA.                       

(1-3/4" Diameter; 2nd 

load only; Delivery not 

according to specs)

$76.70 EA. (1-3/4" 

Diameter; 1st load 

only; Delivery not 

according to specs) $49.00 EA. $80.00 EA. $103.00 EA.

Quercus rubra (Red Oak)               

Acceptable substitute:                      

Quercus palustris (Pin Oak) NO BID NO BID

$89.70 EA.                     

(2" Diameter; 1st load 

only; Delivery not 

according to specs) $56.00 EA.

12 @ $80.00 EA. 1st 

load; 6 @ $95.00 EA. 

2nd load $105.00 EA.

Syringa reticulata                                         

(Japanese Tree Lilac) $69.00 EA.

(1-3/4" Diameter; 2nd 

load only; Delivery not 

according to specs)

$50.51 EA. (2nd load 

only; Delivery not 

according to specs) $56.00 EA. $94.00 EA.

6 @ $125.00 EA. 1st 

load; 10 @ $135.00 EA. 

2nd load

Ulmus x 'Frontier'                                      

(Frontier Elm) NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.00 EA. $85.00 EA. $103.00 EA.

Ulmus x 'Morton'                                         

(Morton Elm) NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.00 EA. $85.00 EA. $100.00 EA.

TOTAL BID $3,862.00 $4,104.00 $5,413.36 $8,730.00 $11,978.00 $15,899.00 

CITY OF MT. PLEASANT

  2011 SPRING TREE BID -- SPECIES TABULATION
Split Delivery - First load delivered week of April 25, Second load delivered week of May 16


